
"Knowledge is knowing that a tomato is a fruit; wisdom is knowing not to put it in a fruit salad."

At Reitigh, our team brings together a unique blend of knowledge and wisdom. Our business domain knowledge
and data engineering expertise enables us to create and implement efficient solutions tailored to the intricacies
of complex processes within financial services firms.

We have decades of collective experience exclusively dedicated to the financial services sector, which has forged
an intimate understanding of individuals' actions, motivations, and the challenges they encounter. Drawing from
our experiences of problem-solving in this area, we have honed a natural and fluid approach to explore, define,
and design solutions with an agile and iterative mindset, enabling our clients to effectively meet and exceed their
data processing and management challenges.

At the core of our identity lies "Réitigh" - a name derived from an Irish verb meaning to solve, to elucidate, and to
bring order.

This name perfectly reflects our daily approach of collaborating with our clients to tackle data processing and
management challenges: spanning regulatory reporting, financial reporting, and BAU processing. We specialise in
breaking down complex processes into simple units of work, and leveraging our low-code framework
"IntegraLynx" to configure scalable, automated, and governed applications - empowering our clients to navigate
their complexities with ease.
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https://www.reitighltd.com

Founded in 2016 by three experts in software development and business consulting, Reitigh emerged from first
hand experiences with the data management challenges faced by financial services companies. The founders
witnessed the struggles of back-office teams in efficiently gathering, processing, and disseminating data for their
daily operations. The absence of suitable tools led them to rely on disconnected Excel spreadsheets for data
processing, creating a cumbersome and inefficient proliferation of processes.

To address this issue, Reitigh developed "IntegraLynx," a revolutionary low-code application development
platform. This innovative tool allows individuals without traditional programming skills to create automated
applications tailored to their specific needs. Since its inception, Reitigh has experienced exceptional organic
growth and now comprises a team of 25 highly capable problem solvers. Their expertise has been sought after by
some of the world's most renowned financial services companies.

In recognition of their remarkable growth and contributions, Reitigh achieved a significant milestone in 2022.
They were named the 3rd fastest-growing software company in Ireland at the prestigious Deloitte Technology
Fast 50 Awards. This accolade solidifies Reitigh's position as a pioneering force in the software industry,
propelling them to new heights in delivering cutting-edge solutions for the financial sector.
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